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Sustainable Tourism: Business Development, Operations, and Management lays out a road map to launching
and building a business in one of today’s most exciting industries. It simplifies the process and outlines real-
life requirements while clearing the path to new business success in the cultural, heritage, nature, and
adventure fields. Written by an eco-development pioneer, the book offers guidance on developing and
implementing a comprehensive sustainable-business plan. From analyzing the market all the way through
hiring and training the right people, the text focuses on the principles of both tourism and business. It
prepares those embarking on new careers to tackle the complexity of sustainability issues by thinking like
entrepreneurs and acting like business owners. Students and professionals can rely on this text as both a
start-up and ongoing implementation reference that will stack the odds of success in their favor.

Sustainable Tourism provides an overview of exciting developments in the sustainable-tourism industry. It
helps new entrepreneurs assess the viability of ideas and products against sustainable criteria. Through
sequential chapters, it delivers step-by-step instructions for minimizing environmental impact, establishing
sustainability practices, obtaining financing, and marketing to and reaching customers. The standards-based
text also examines how the United Nations World Tourism Organization (UNWTO) Sustainability
Guidelines shape sustainable tourism, providing a global framework from which to build the skills needed
for success.

Key features include the following:

• 13 online video case studies of sustainable tourism destinations from around the world give students a
global text from which to build their own businesses and provide a model for how sustainable tourism works.

• An online workbook guides learners through the completion of a business plan by the end of the term.

• An online image bank presents photos, figures, and tables from the book that may be downloaded for use in
presentations.

• Forms and worksheets from the book are available for download.

• A professional development workbook, “Creating a Tourism Career from Scratch” (appendix B), is a
reference for entrepreneurs starting or advancing in their careers.

Loaded with case studies, the book illustrates what works and what doesn’t when starting a sustainable
tourism business. It describes how to integrate sustainability practices into daily operations, maximize the
use of the web and social media in marketing, and overcome challenges in sustainable tourism. The text
covers every important topic in a business start-up, including financial forecasting and analysis, customer
service systems, hiring, training, and managing turnover.

Sustainable Tourism: Business Development, Operations and Management is the starting point for all who
want to develop an eco-friendly product, integrate sustainability principles into their businesses, and turn
their dreams into a business reality.
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From reader reviews:

Dale Winsett:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try to and must have the time or they will get lots of
stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely
indeed. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then
do you try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the particular
book you have read is usually Sustainable Tourism With Web Resource: Business Development, Operations,
and Management.

Michael Canton:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its cover may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the
outside search likes. Maybe you answer might be Sustainable Tourism With Web Resource: Business
Development, Operations, and Management why because the amazing cover that make you consider about
the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover.
Your reading 6th sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Ronald Searle:

This Sustainable Tourism With Web Resource: Business Development, Operations, and Management is
great book for you because the content and that is full of information for you who always deal with world
and possess to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it data accurately using great plan
word or we can declare no rambling sentences included. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have
whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences but hard core information with
attractive delivering sentences. Having Sustainable Tourism With Web Resource: Business Development,
Operations, and Management in your hand like getting the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous 1.
We can say that no guide that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen second right but this guide already do
that. So , this can be good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt that will?

James Edgar:

You can spend your free time to see this book this reserve. This Sustainable Tourism With Web Resource:
Business Development, Operations, and Management is simple to develop you can read it in the area, in the
beach, train and soon. If you did not get much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the e-book.
It is make you quicker to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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