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Seminar paper from the year 2008 in the subject English Language and Literature Studies - Literature, grade:
2, University of Frankfurt (Main), 24 entries in the bibliography, language: English, abstract: Harry Potter is
a heptalogy of fantasy novels by the English author Joanne K. Rowling about an adolescent boy named
Harry Potter, first published in England in 1997. Harry Potter attends the Hogwarts School of Witchcraft and
Wizardry, a boarding school for young wizards and witches. Up to his eleventh birthday his cruel relatives,
the Dursleys, have raised the orphaned Harry. On this day he learns that he is a wizard and has been invited
to attend Hogwarts. The story is mostly set on the school premises, with each of the seven volumes
describing a school year at Hogwarts and a year of Harry's growing-up. The main topic is Harry Potter's fight
against the evil wizard Lord Voldemort who killed Harry's parents when he was still an infant. Throughout
the story the Dark Lord Voldemort gains more and more power and tries to kill Harry several times. In
Hallows the climax is reached and the final battle between Harry and Lord Voldemort which will decide the
future of the wizarding world.

The fight of good versus evil is one of the oldest topics of mankind. Starting with the original sin in the
Garden of Eden this fight has dominated moral concepts of the Christian world ever since.

This paper presents an analysis of how good and evil are portrayed and presented in the Harry Potter series.
First, there is a description of Christian motifs in the series and how these motifs can be compared to certain
characters in the books. Second, 'good' characters such as Harry's close friends Ron and Hermione, and
Harry's mentor, Professor Dumbledore, are described and characterised as to why they are part of the 'good'.
Third, the 'evil' opponents Draco Malfoy and the evil Dark Lord Voldemort are analysed as to how they
exhibit 'evil' behaviour. The last chapter deals with the question of whether Harry Potter is 'good' or 'evil' as
he does not always act as an exemplary student.
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From reader reviews:

Silvia Washington:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite reserve and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the book entitled Good vs. Evil in Harry Potter. Try to the actual book Good vs. Evil in Harry
Potter as your buddy. It means that it can to become your friend when you experience alone and beside
associated with course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The
book makes you more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , we need to make new
experience along with knowledge with this book.

Teresa Thomas:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they are still students or this for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't
desire do that. You must know how great and important the book Good vs. Evil in Harry Potter. All type of
book is it possible to see on many methods. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Sherrie Smith:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what your own problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man or woman?
If you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have free
time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They must answer that question due to the fact
just their can do in which. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is correct. Because
start from on guardería until university need this particular Good vs. Evil in Harry Potter to read.

Hattie Adkins:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled
Good vs. Evil in Harry Potter the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect
that maybe unidentified for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a
reserve then become one web form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get just before.
The Good vs. Evil in Harry Potter giving you a different experience more than blown away your head but
also giving you useful data for your better life within this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing
pattern here is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished examining it, like
winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?
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