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"Science fiction is the characteristic literary genre of the century. It is the genre that stands in opposition to
literary modernism." So says David G. Hartwell in his introduction to The Science Fiction Century, an
anthology spanning a hundred years of science fiction, from its birth in the 1890s to the future it predicted.

David G. Hartwell is a World Fantasy Award-winning editor and anthologist who has twice before redefined
a genre--first the horror field with The Dark Descent, then the subgenre of hard science fiction with The
Ascent of Wonder, coedited with Kathryn Cramer. Now, Hartwell has compiled the mother of all definitive
anthologies, guaranteed to change not only the way the science fiction field views itself but also the way the
rest of literature views the field.

The Science Fiction Century includes stories from the founding fathers of the field, such as H.G. Wells, C.S.
Lewis, Jack London, and Rudyard Kipling; beloved mainstays of the genre, such as Philip José Farmer,
Roger Zelazny, Jack Vance, and Poul Anderson; noted female writers, including Connie Willis, Nancy
Kress, and James Tiptree, Jr.; and writers who have hit their stride in the last two decades, such as Bruce
Sterling, William Gibson, Michael Swanwick, and James Morrow. Hartwell has also included writers widely
recognized outside the genre, such as E.M. Forster, Michael Shaara, and John Crowley; and translations of
foreign writers' formative works, including Dino Buzzati and Wolfgang Jeschke. This is must-have
anthology for all literary interests.
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From reader reviews:

Connie King:

The book The Science Fiction Century can give more knowledge and also the precise product information
about everything you want. Why then must we leave a good thing like a book The Science Fiction Century?
Several of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It is
absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you may
give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book The Science Fiction Century has simple shape
but you know: it has great and large function for you. You can appear the enormous world by available and
read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Phyllis Belser:

The book with title The Science Fiction Century contains a lot of information that you can study it. You can
get a lot of benefit after read this book. This specific book exist new know-how the information that exist in
this book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the
improvement of the world. This book will bring you in new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book
in your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Tom Baptist:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity together with
family or just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by looking at a
book. Ugh, ya think reading a book can actually hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It okay
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like The Science Fiction
Century which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.

Lisa Sullivan:

Within this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What
you need to do is just spending your time little but quite enough to have a look at some books. On the list of
books in the top listing in your reading list is The Science Fiction Century. This book which is qualified as
The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upwards and review this
reserve you can get many advantages.
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