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Practical, scriptural discussions of tough topics such as polygamy, genocide, and the role of women in
the Old Testament

The God of the Old Testament can seem very foreign to Christians. His actions appear to starkly contrast
with the God of grace in the New Testament and with modern notions of justice and propriety.

In this short volume, Old Testament scholar Walter Kaiser devotes each chapter to a different difficult
subject, including creation, the wrath of God, the genocide of the Canaanites, God’s knowledge of the future,
polygamy, Satan, the view of women, and application of the Old Testament law. He addresses each topic in a
practical, accessible tone, with pastoral insight and humor, consistently focusing on the Scriptures.

The reader will find that there are not two different gods in the Bible and that the Old Testament is not an
antique artifact that should now be jettisoned from Christianity. The Old Testament and the God it depicts is
One with the God and Father of our Lord Jesus Christ. His actions, when properly understood, are not at
variance with the New Testament; rather, a view of the beautiful unity in the Bible as a whole will strengthen
the church’s faith and aid in Christian witness and apologetics.
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From reader reviews:

Harley Fabry:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to
take a go walking, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or even read a book allowed Tough
Questions About God and His Actions in the Old Testament? Maybe it is to become best activity for you.
You understand beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can better than
before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have different opinion?

Betty Norsworthy:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be update about what going on or details even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe
will probably update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to
you actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This Tough Questions About God and His
Actions in the Old Testament is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because
book serves what you want and wish in this era.

David Paras:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read
some sort of book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent all day long
to reading a e-book. The book Tough Questions About God and His Actions in the Old Testament it is rather
good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this
book. Should you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy often the e-book. You can
m0ore very easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book offers high
quality.

Thomas Baier:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book but also novel and Tough Questions About God and His
Actions in the Old Testament or even others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the
great a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher or
students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to include their knowledge. In additional case, beside
science guide, any other book likes Tough Questions About God and His Actions in the Old Testament to
make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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