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First published in 1992, Helen Fisher's Anatomy of Love quickly became a classic. Since then, Fisher has
conducted pioneering brain research on lust, romantic love, and attachment; gathered data on more than
80,000 people to explain why you love who you love; and collected information on more than 30,000 men
and women on sexting, hooking up, friends with benefits, and other current trends in courtship and
marriage.This is a cutting-edge tour de force that traces human family life from its origins in Africa over 20
million years ago to the Internet dating sites and bedrooms of today. It's got it all: the copulatory gaze and
other natural courting ploys; the who, when, where, and why of adultery; love addictions; Fisher's discovery
of four broad chemically based personality styles and what each seeks in romance; the newest data on
worldwide (biologically based) patterns of divorce; how and why men and women think differently; the real
story of women, men, and power; the rise-and fall-of the sexual double standard; and what brain science tells
us about how to make and keep a happy partnership.
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From reader reviews:

James Baron:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era which is always change and progress. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know which one you should start with. This Anatomy of Love: A Natural History of
Mating, Marriage, and Why We Stray is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why,
because this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Randell Easley:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading behavior give
you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of book
you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want feel happy read one
together with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the Anatomy of Love: A Natural
History of Mating, Marriage, and Why We Stray is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unforeseen
experience.

Candice Sharkey:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, short story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not trying Anatomy of Love: A
Natural History of Mating, Marriage, and Why We Stray that give your enjoyment preference will be
satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the means for
people to know world considerably better then how they react towards the world. It can't be explained
constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to become success
person. So , for all you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you are able to pick Anatomy of
Love: A Natural History of Mating, Marriage, and Why We Stray become your starter.

Charles Frye:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will
make anyone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper,
book, and soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The actual
book that recommended for you is Anatomy of Love: A Natural History of Mating, Marriage, and Why We
Stray this e-book consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This book was
represented how does the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer use to explain it is easy to
understand. The actual writer made some investigation when he makes this book. Here is why this book ideal



all of you.
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