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In this provocative challenge to prevailing views of New Testament sources, Dennis MacDonald argues that
the origins of passages in the book of Acts are to be found not in early Christian legends but in the epics of
Homer. MacDonald focuses on four passages in the book of Acts, examines their potential parallels in the
Iliad and concludes that the author of Acts composed them using famous scenes in Homer's work as a model.
literature, MacDonald shows how the story generated a vibrant, mimetic literary tradition long before Luke
composed the Acts. Luke could have expected educated readers to recognize his transformation of these tales
and to see that the Christian God and heroes were superior to Homeric gods and heroes. Building upon and
extending the analytic methods of his earlier book, The Homeric Epics and the Gospel of Mark, MacDonald
opens an original and promising appreciation not only of Acts but also of the composition of early Christian
narrative in general.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Mills:

This Does the New Testament Imitate Homer?: Four Cases from the Acts of the Apostles are reliable for you
who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The key reason why of this Does the New Testament
Imitate Homer?: Four Cases from the Acts of the Apostles can be one of many great books you must have is
usually giving you more than just simple reading food but feed anyone with information that possibly will
shock your previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and
whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed people. Beside that this Does the New Testament Imitate
Homer?: Four Cases from the Acts of the Apostles forcing you to have an enormous of experience such as
rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's
have it and luxuriate in reading.

James Robicheaux:

This book untitled Does the New Testament Imitate Homer?: Four Cases from the Acts of the Apostles to be
one of several books in which best seller in this year, here is because when you read this reserve you can get
a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book retail outlet or you can order it
through online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, since
you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this e-book
from your list.

Jimmy Stone:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic
as in the outside look likes. Maybe you answer is usually Does the New Testament Imitate Homer?: Four
Cases from the Acts of the Apostles why because the fantastic cover that make you consider regarding the
content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside or perhaps
cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Rachel Haley:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is published or printed or highlighted from each source in which filled update of news.
Within this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social such as newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
in search of the Does the New Testament Imitate Homer?: Four Cases from the Acts of the Apostles when
you needed it?
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