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In this new revised edition, Block explains what REITs are, where they fit into a diversified portfolio, and
how to invest successfully. Investing in REITs is an enlightening, practical look how they work, and what
properties they own. Learn all essential aspects of REITs, including: The ABCs of successful REIT
investment * How to spot blue-chip REITs * How REITs compare to other investments * How to build a
diversified REIT portfolio * REIT mutual funds * and more! The experts agree: REITs (Real Estate
Investment Trusts) should be a part of every serious investor's diversified portfolio. All the essentials are
there - low volatility, consistent and steady profits, impressive dividends, convenient liquidity, low
correlation with other asset classes and, most importantly, professional management - yet to take advantage
of this investment vehicle, understanding the unusual features and performance characteristics of REITs is
key. Investing in REITs - Revised & Updated Edition is an enlightening, practical look at what REITs are,
how they work, what properties they own, and why they deserve an important place in any diversified
investment portfolio. Ralph Block's classic is newly updated to reflect all the latest changes in the industry.
Block provides cogent analysis of what is unique about REITs and cuts to the chase on how to make money
with them while avoiding common pitfalls. Succinct, informative, and user-friendly in its layout and
presentation, this guide makes the world of REITs accessible to all investors. This essential guide offers: •
The ABCs of successful REIT investment • How to spot blue-chip REITs • A concise history of REITs and
how they compare to other investments • How to build a diversified REIT portfolio • REIT mutual fund
opportunities and performance • Important new developments and strategies in the REIT industry, including
specific sectors of real estate, asset recycling, and joint venture strategies
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From reader reviews:

Wanda Leopard:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading addiction give you
lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book
this improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of book you read, if you
want get more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want experience happy read one along
with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the Real Estate Investment Trusts, Investing in
REITS is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Judy Young:

This Real Estate Investment Trusts, Investing in REITS are reliable for you who want to become a successful
person, why. The main reason of this Real Estate Investment Trusts, Investing in REITS can be one of many
great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple reading food but feed you with
information that perhaps will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it just about
everywhere and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Real Estate
Investment Trusts, Investing in REITS giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary,
giving you trial run of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and
luxuriate in reading.

Colton Fierros:

The reason why? Because this Real Estate Investment Trusts, Investing in REITS is an unordinary book that
the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap this but latter it will surprise you with the secret it inside.
Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who write the book in such awesome way makes the
content interior easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This unique book will
give you a lot of rewards than the other book get such as help improving your ability and your critical
thinking means. So , still want to delay having that book? If I have been you I will go to the publication store
hurriedly.

Eunice Huynh:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book seemed to be rare? Why
so many question for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but novel and Real Estate Investment Trusts, Investing in REITS or even
others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel need to
read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or even students especially. Those publications
are helping them to include their knowledge. In additional case, beside science book, any other book likes
Real Estate Investment Trusts, Investing in REITS to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of
book like this.
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