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“An important missing story from the heroic age of Antarctic exploration.”?Laurence Gonzales,
author of Deep Survival

On January 17, 1913, alone and near starvation, Douglas Mawson, leader of the Australasian Antarctic
Expedition, was hauling a sledge to get back to base camp. The dogs were gone. Now Mawson himself
plunged through a snow bridge, dangling over an abyss by the sledge harness. A line of poetry gave him the
will to haul himself back to the surface.

Mawson was sometimes reduced to crawling, and one night he discovered that the soles of his feet had
completely detached from the flesh beneath. On February 8, when he staggered back to base, his features
unrecognizably skeletal, the first teammate to reach him blurted out, “Which one are you?”

This thrilling and almost unbelievable account establishes Mawson in his rightful place as one of the greatest
polar explorers and expedition leaders. It is illustrated by a trove of Frank Hurley’s famous Antarctic
photographs, many never before published in the United States. 24 pages of illustrations
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From reader reviews:

Pierre Taylor:

With other case, little people like to read book Alone on the Ice: The Greatest Survival Story in the History
of Exploration. You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. Providing we know about
how is important a new book Alone on the Ice: The Greatest Survival Story in the History of Exploration.
You can add know-how and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, because from
book you can know everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple
factor until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can open a book as well as searching by
internet unit. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's read.

Josette Roscoe:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the title Alone on the Ice: The
Greatest Survival Story in the History of Exploration suitable to you? The particular book was written by
famous writer in this era. The particular book untitled Alone on the Ice: The Greatest Survival Story in the
History of Explorationis one of several books this everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired a lot of
people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever
know previous to. The author explained their concept in the simple way, so all of people can easily to
recognise the core of this publication. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. So
that you can see the represented of the world within this book.

Scott Hagen:

This Alone on the Ice: The Greatest Survival Story in the History of Exploration is brand new way for you
who has fascination to look for some information because it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you
into it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having little digest in reading this Alone on
the Ice: The Greatest Survival Story in the History of Exploration can be the light food for yourself because
the information inside this specific book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books build itself in the form
that is certainly reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in
publication form make them feel tired even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there is not any in reading a
guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss the
item! Just read this e-book type for your better life in addition to knowledge.

Flor Rieke:

Reserve is one of source of understanding. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen have to have book to know the upgrade information of year in order to year. As
we know those textbooks have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, could also bring us
to around the world. Through the book Alone on the Ice: The Greatest Survival Story in the History of
Exploration we can get more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To be creative person



must prefer to read a book. Simply choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't be doubt to
change your life at this time book Alone on the Ice: The Greatest Survival Story in the History of
Exploration. You can more pleasing than now.
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