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Jewish life in the United States is too often told from an East Coast perspective. Lone Stars of David presents
a different panorama, with narratives of Jews who ventured to Texas before the battle of the Alamo, who
fought for the Confederacy, who herded cattle up the Chisholm Trail, who drilled for oil, and who forged
Jewish communities far from New York’s Lower East Side. These essays also describe how Texas Jews
faced the Ku Klux Klan and how they respond today to Christian fundamentalism.

This anthology examines the famous, with a close-up look at Neiman-Marcus, the chain synonymous with
remarkable luxuries. It profiles Zale jewelers, founded by a young immigrant who grew into an international
business icon. Another essay opens a window to the Dell Computer Corporation, with the story of Michael
Dell, the college dropout whose philanthropy changed the course of the Austin Jewish community.

Written by historians, journalists, and rabbis who have experienced Texas firsthand, these essays challenge
stereotypes. One chapter discounts the impact of crypto-Jews who fled the Spanish Inquisition for the New
World. Another defies conventional wisdom about southern views toward Zionism. El Paso emerges as the
unlikely home of a Holocaust museum. The book’s essay on Jews in Texas politics analyzes the import of
populist candidate Kinky Friedman and introduces Marjorie Arsht, a grassroots organizer whose living room
was the setting for Republican George H. W. Bush’s first foray into politics.

The Jewish population of Texas totals 131,000, a mere 0.6 percent of the state’s residents, yet its impact has
been widespread. This anthology explores the resiliency, diversity, and adaptability of Jews in the Lone Star
State, a place with its own powerful sense of identity.
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From reader reviews:

Effie Peoples:

Now a day people that Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not involve people to be aware of each information they get. How many
people to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book.
Examining a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Lone Stars of David:
The Jews of Texas (Brandeis Series in American Jewish History, Culture, and Life) book as this book offers
you rich information and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no
doubt in it you know.

Brenda Hedstrom:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this all time you only find reserve that need more
time to be go through. Lone Stars of David: The Jews of Texas (Brandeis Series in American Jewish History,
Culture, and Life) can be your answer as it can be read by you actually who have those short extra time
problems.

Stephanie Carter:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen need book to know the revise information of year to help year. As we know those guides
have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. From the book Lone
Stars of David: The Jews of Texas (Brandeis Series in American Jewish History, Culture, and Life) we can
get more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? Being creative person must love to read a book.
Just choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with this book
Lone Stars of David: The Jews of Texas (Brandeis Series in American Jewish History, Culture, and Life).
You can more desirable than now.

Cathie Moss:

Some individuals said that they feel bored when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt this when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose often the book Lone Stars of David: The Jews of Texas
(Brandeis Series in American Jewish History, Culture, and Life) to make your own reading is interesting.
Your current skill of reading expertise is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose very simple
book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the sensation about book and studying especially. It is to be
first opinion for you to like to open up a book and study it. Beside that the publication Lone Stars of David:
The Jews of Texas (Brandeis Series in American Jewish History, Culture, and Life) can to be your new
friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of these time.
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