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Since it first appeared on bookshelves, The Bipolar Child has made an indelible mark on the field of
psychiatry and has become the resource that families rely upon. Now, with more than 200,000 copies
sold, the first book about early-onset bipolar disorder is completely revised and expanded.

Bipolar disorder—manic depression—was once thought to be rare in children. Now researchers are
discovering not only that bipolar disorder can begin early in life, but that it is much more common than ever
imagined. Yet the illness is often misdiagnosed and mistreated with medications that can exacerbate the
symptoms. Why? Bipolar disorder manifests itself differently in children than in adults, and in children there
is an overlap of symptoms with other childhood psychiatric disorders. As a result, these kids may be labeled
with any of a number of psychiatric conditions: “ADHD,” “depression,” “oppositional defiant disorder,”
“obsessive-compulsive disorder,” or “generalized anxiety disorder.” Too often they are treated with
stimulants or antidepressants—medications that can actually worsen the bipolar condition.
Since the publication of its first edition, The Bipolar Child has helped many thousands of families get to the
root cause of their children’s behaviors and symptoms and find what they need to know. The Papoloses
comprehensively detail the diagnosis, explain how to find good treatment and medications, and advise
parents about ways to advocate effectively for their children in school. In this edition, a greatly expanded
education chapter describes all the changes in educational law due to the 2004 reauthorization of IDEA
(Individuals with Disabilities Education Act), and offers a multitude of ideas for parents and educators to
help the children feel more comfortable in the academic environment. The book also contains crucial
information about hospitalization, the importance of neuropsychological testing (with a recommended
battery of tests), and the world of insurance. Included in these pages is information on promising new drugs,
greater insight into the special concerns of teenagers, and additional sections on the impact of the illness on
the family. In addition, an entirely new chapter focuses on major advances taking place in the field of
molecular genetics and offers hope that researchers will better understand the illness and develop more
targeted and easier-to-tolerate medicines.
The Bipolar Child is rich with the voices of parents, siblings, and the children themselves, opening up the
long-closed world of the families struggling with this condition. This book has already proved to be an
invaluable resource for parents whose children suffer from mood disorders, as well as for the professionals
who treat and educate them, and this new edition is sure to continue to light the way.
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From reader reviews:

Maria Saad:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important for people. The book The Bipolar Child: The Definitive and Reassuring Guide to
Childhood's Most Misunderstood Disorder, Third Edition seemed to be making you to know about other
expertise and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The book The
Bipolar Child: The Definitive and Reassuring Guide to Childhood's Most Misunderstood Disorder, Third
Edition is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to become your friend when you really
feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship
with the book The Bipolar Child: The Definitive and Reassuring Guide to Childhood's Most Misunderstood
Disorder, Third Edition. You never truly feel lose out for everything should you read some books.

Brenda Lee:

The guide with title The Bipolar Child: The Definitive and Reassuring Guide to Childhood's Most
Misunderstood Disorder, Third Edition has a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of
profit after read this book. This specific book exist new know-how the information that exist in this
publication represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to learn how the
improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you in new era of the syndication. You can read
the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Connie Pauls:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind expertise
or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as compared to
can satisfy your short space of time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need more
time to be go through. The Bipolar Child: The Definitive and Reassuring Guide to Childhood's Most
Misunderstood Disorder, Third Edition can be your answer as it can be read by you actually who have those
short free time problems.

Bradley Cox:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You can view that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended
to your account is The Bipolar Child: The Definitive and Reassuring Guide to Childhood's Most
Misunderstood Disorder, Third Edition this book consist a lot of the information in the condition of this
world now. This book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that
writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some study when he makes this



book. That's why this book suited all of you.
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