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When nice-girl Kate McGraw finds herself working at Tasty, a magazine with its finger on the pulse of
modern style, she’s finally able to put her flair for fashion to good use. But can she keep up with the Tasty
staffers? Ethereally beautiful and extremely emaciated, they stay out all night, never look the worse for wear,
and are always dressed to kill.

Like everyone else around the office, Kate finds herself begrudgingly reading dispatches from a snarky
industry blog that dubs her colleagues “bloodthirsty vamps.” She knows they don’t mean it literally, but . . .
she’s heard whispers of “fashion murders” and she has noticed strange things around the office: Like, why
doesn’t her boss get laminates to fix her sharp teeth? Why are the blinds always drawn, and why is there a
no-garlic policy in the cafeteria?

As well-dressed bodies begin to pile up near all the hot places, Kate has to wonder if there’s a serial killer
loose with a grudge against the stylish. Or if the truth is even more sinister: Are Kate’s coworkers actually
undead? And, if so, can she design an exit strategy before she finds herself at Tasty forever?
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From reader reviews:

Tenesha Little:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you can
add your knowledge by the guide entitled Blood Is the New Black: A Novel. Try to face the book Blood Is
the New Black: A Novel as your good friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you truly feel alone
and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes
you more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , let me make new experience and
knowledge with this book.

Sheila Seim:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the particular
information inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on
what kind of e-book you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want
truly feel happy read one using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The Blood Is the New
Black: A Novel is kind of publication which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Jason Young:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many ways to share
the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
looking at a book especially fiction book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the
characters do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read
this Blood Is the New Black: A Novel, you can tells your family, friends and also soon about yours book.
Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a guide.

Veda Howard:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get lot of
stress from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely
without a doubt. People is human not really a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are there when
the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try this one,
reading publications. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, typically the book you
have read is definitely Blood Is the New Black: A Novel.
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