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"A tale drenched in drama and blood, heroism and cowardice, loyalty and betrayal."—Jonathan
Yardley, The Washington Post

Beevor's latest book Ardennes 1944: The Battle of the Bulge is now available from Viking Books 

The Red Army had much to avenge when it finally reached the frontiers of the Third Reich in January 1945.
Frenzied by their terrible experiences with Wehrmacht and SS brutality, they wreaked havoc—tanks
crushing refugee columns, mass rape, pillage, and unimaginable destruction. Hundreds of thousands of
women are children froze to death or were massacred; more than seven million fled westward from the fury
of the Red Army. It was the most terrifying example of fire and sword ever known. 

Antony Beevor has reconstructed the experiences of those millions caught up in the nightmare of the Third
Reich's final collapse. The Fall of Berlin is a terrible story of pride, stupidity, fanaticism, revenge, and
savagery, yet it is also one of astonishing endurance, self-sacrifice, and survival against all odds.
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From reader reviews:

Virgil Arriola:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the data
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your children,
there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their
ability in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to their book. One of them is this The
Fall of Berlin 1945.

Howard Foster:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes reading through,
not only science book but in addition novel and The Fall of Berlin 1945 or others sources were given
understanding for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel would like to read more and more.
Science publication was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those books are helping them to
add their knowledge. In other case, beside science book, any other book likes The Fall of Berlin 1945 to
make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like this one.

Leslie Yazzie:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is unique. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is named of book The Fall of
Berlin 1945. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it could add your
knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about e-book. It
can bring you from one destination for a other place.

Eric Green:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or highlighted from each source in which filled update of news.
Within this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
seeking the The Fall of Berlin 1945 when you essential it?
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