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“Long before the word ‘entrepreneur’ became popular, the concept still existed.”

In the late 1950s, Glen Allan, Mississippi was a poor cotton community. For many, it was a time and place
where opportunities were limited by social and legal constraints that were beyond their control. It was a time
and place where few dared to dream.

For most, the work was in the fields where the sun was hot, the days were long and the wages were low. It
was an accepted way of life that had been passed down for generations and, from the time young Clifton
Taulbert could walk, he too was expected to climb aboard Mr. Walter’s field truck and find his place among
his peers.

Yet one man made a difference - an unlikely entrepreneur who defied convention and dared to dream. That
man was Clifton’s Uncle Cleve.

Based on his own life experience, Pulitzer nominee Clifton Taulbert has teamed up with entrepreneurial
thought leader Gary Schoeniger to create Who Owns the Ice House? – a powerful and compelling story that
captures the essence of an entrepreneurial mindset and the unlimited opportunities it can provide.

Drawing on the entrepreneurial life lessons he gained from his Uncle Cleve, Who Owns the Ice House?
chronicles Taulbert’s journey from his life in the Mississippi Delta at the height of legal segregation to being
recognized by Time Magazine as “one of our nation’s most outstanding emerging entrepreneurs.” While
Taulbert describes the life-changing influence of his Uncle Cleve, Schoeniger captures the entrepreneurial
life lessons, their timeless application and the unlimited opportunities they can provide.

Who Owns The Ice House? delivers an important message, one that reaches into the past to remind us of the
timeless and universal principles that can empower anyone to succeed.
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From reader reviews:

Bernice Fugate:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like looking
for your favorite book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the e-book entitled Who Owns the Ice House? Eight Life Lessons From an Unlikely
Entrepreneur. Try to stumble through book Who Owns the Ice House? Eight Life Lessons From an Unlikely
Entrepreneur as your friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you feel alone and beside that
course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you more
confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , let's make new experience and also
knowledge with this book.

Danielle Smith:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try to pick
one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its protect may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the outside seem
likes. Maybe you answer might be Who Owns the Ice House? Eight Life Lessons From an Unlikely
Entrepreneur why because the wonderful cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint
you actually. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense
will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Mark Hoffman:

This Who Owns the Ice House? Eight Life Lessons From an Unlikely Entrepreneur is great publication for
you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who else always deal with world and get
to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it data accurately using great arrange word or we
can point out no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole details in it.
Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but challenging core information with wonderful
delivering sentences. Having Who Owns the Ice House? Eight Life Lessons From an Unlikely Entrepreneur
in your hand like finding the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no
publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen second right but this reserve already do that. So , this is
certainly good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt this?

Bertram Staten:

Reading a book to get new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you read a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as well



as soon. The Who Owns the Ice House? Eight Life Lessons From an Unlikely Entrepreneur provide you with
new experience in studying a book.
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