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A sharecropper, a warrior, and a truth-telling prophet, Fannie Lou Hamer (1917-1977) stands as a powerful
symbol not only of the 1960s black freedom movement, but also of the enduring human struggle against
oppression. A Voice That Could Stir an Army is a rhetorical biography that tells the story of Hamer's life by
focusing on how she employed symbols-- images, words, and even material objects such as the ballot, food,
and clothing--to construct persuasive public personae, to influence audiences, and to effect social change.

Drawing upon dozens of newly recovered Hamer texts and recent interviews with Hamer's friends, family,
and fellow activists, Maegan Parker Brooks moves chronologically through Hamer's life. Brooks recounts
Hamer's early influences, her intersection with the black freedom movement, and her rise to prominence at
the 1964 Democratic National Convention. Brooks also considers Hamer's lesser-known contributions to the
fight against poverty and to feminist politics before analyzing how Hamer is remembered posthumously. The
book concludes by emphasizing what remains rhetorical about Hamer's biography, using the 2012 statue and
museum dedication in Hamer's hometown of Ruleville, Mississippi, to examine the larger social, political,
and historiographical implications of her legacy.

The sustained consideration of Hamer's wide-ranging use of symbols and the reconstruction of her legacy
provided within the pages of A Voice That Could Stir an Army enrich understanding of this key historical
figure. This book also demonstrates how rhetorical analysis complements historical reconstruction to explain
the dynamics of how social movements actually operate.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Salas:

Exactly why? Because this A Voice That Could Stir an Army: Fannie Lou Hamer and the Rhetoric of the
Black Freedom Movement (Race, Rhetoric, and Media Series) is an unordinary book that the inside of the
publication waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will zap you with the secret this inside. Reading this
book beside it was fantastic author who have write the book in such incredible way makes the content
interior easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you
a lot of rewards than the other book possess such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking
approach. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were being you I will go to the e-book store
hurriedly.

Jodie Kahl:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this A Voice That Could Stir an Army:
Fannie Lou Hamer and the Rhetoric of the Black Freedom Movement (Race, Rhetoric, and Media Series) e-
book written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book which might be understand by
anyone who else read the book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and
composing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still hesitation A Voice That Could
Stir an Army: Fannie Lou Hamer and the Rhetoric of the Black Freedom Movement (Race, Rhetoric, and
Media Series) as good book not just by the cover but also with the content. This is one book that can break
don't judge book by its cover, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your
looking at sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Tammy Paradis:

With this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What
you are related is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books.
One of many books in the top checklist in your reading list is actually A Voice That Could Stir an Army:
Fannie Lou Hamer and the Rhetoric of the Black Freedom Movement (Race, Rhetoric, and Media Series).
This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning out to be precious
person. By looking right up and review this guide you can get many advantages.

Jason Davis:

A lot of guide has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by internet on social media. You
can choose the best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is
named of book A Voice That Could Stir an Army: Fannie Lou Hamer and the Rhetoric of the Black Freedom
Movement (Race, Rhetoric, and Media Series). You can add your knowledge by it. Without departing the



printed book, it may add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most crucial that, you
must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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