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A STOLEN SPELL

A dead sorcerer in the Underworld named Henry Winslow, a contemporary of Aleister Crowley and former
member of The Golden Dawn, steals a spell from The Forbidden Texts in order to fulfill the prophecy of the
Thrice Born.  He divides himself into three aspects and goes back in time to steal the Emerald Tablets of
Thoth from the Great Pyramid of Giza.  He wants true immortality and to change the course of history.

A MODERN CHAMPION

Jonathan Shade’s old friend, Sharon, shows up with the master of time, Chronos, to send Jonathan and his
team into the past to find and kill Winslow. 

First stop: ancient Egypt

Jonathan and Kelly arrive in Egypt during the reign of King Tutankhamun.  As they appear from nothing,
they are mistaken for gods, but when Tut is murdered during a chariot race, things get out of control.

At stake is, well, everything.  Because if Winslow succeeds, the world as we know it will no longer exist,
wiped from the sands of time…

Here begins a three volume time travel sequence that changes everything!

 

The Jonathan Shade series so far:

Modern Sorcery

Acheron Highway

Dragon Gate

Anubis Nights

Sunset Specters

Wizard's Nocturne

Razor Dreams
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From reader reviews:

Clyde Welch:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a move, shopping,
or went to the actual Mall. How about open or even read a book allowed Anubis Nights: The Fourth
Jonathan Shade Novel? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your
time with the favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have
various other opinion?

Maria Freeman:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important for people. The book Anubis Nights: The Fourth Jonathan Shade
Novel seemed to be making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more
information. It is extremely advantages for you. The publication Anubis Nights: The Fourth Jonathan Shade
Novel is not only giving you far more new information but also to get your friend when you truly feel bored.
You can spend your spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship using the book Anubis Nights:
The Fourth Jonathan Shade Novel. You never sense lose out for everything when you read some books.

Larry Swartz:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you will have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Anubis Nights: The Fourth
Jonathan Shade Novel, you are able to enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still need to miss it?
What kind of hang type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its
identified as reading friends.

Robert Barker:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that query was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person such as reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that reading is
very important along with book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update regarding something by book.
Numerous books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is niagra Anubis Nights: The Fourth
Jonathan Shade Novel.
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