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Essential Skills for a Successful IT Security Career

Learn the fundamentals of computer and information security while getting complete coverage of all the
objectives for the latest release of the CompTIA Security+ certification exam. This up-to-date, full-color
guide discusses communication, infrastructure, operational security, attack prevention, disaster recovery,
computer forensics, and much more. Written and edited by leaders in the field, Principles of Computer
Security: CompTIA Security+ and Beyond, Third Edition will help you pass CompTIA Security+ exam SY0-
301 and become an IT security expert. From McGraw-Hill?a Gold-Level CompTIA Authorized Partner,
this book offers Official CompTIA Approved Quality Content.

Find out how to:

Ensure operational, organizational, and physical security●

Use cryptography and public key infrastructures (PKIs)●

Secure remote access, wireless, and virtual private networks (VPNs)●

Harden network devices, operating systems, and applications●

Defend against network attacks, such as denial of service, spoofing, hijacking, and password guessing●

Combat viruses, worms, Trojan horses, logic bombs, time bombs, and rootkits●

Manage e-mail, instant messaging, and web security●

Understand secure software development requirements●

Enable disaster recovery and business continuity●

Implement risk, change, and privilege management measures●

Handle computer forensics and incident response●

Understand legal, ethical, and privacy issues●

The CD-ROM features:

Two full practice exams●

PDF copy of the book●

Each chapter includes:

Learning objectives●

Photographs and illustrations●

Real-world examples●

Try This! and Cross Check exercises●

Key terms highlighted●

Tech Tips, Notes, and Warnings●



Exam Tips●

End-of-chapter quizzes and lab projects●
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From reader reviews:

Karen Plum:

This book untitled Principles of Computer Security: CompTIA Security+ and Beyond [With CDROM]
(Official Comptia Guide) to be one of several books which best seller in this year, here is because when you
read this publication you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book
shop or you can order it by using online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you
personally to past this book from your list.

Orville Norman:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine,
book, and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended to you personally is Principles of Computer Security: CompTIA Security+ and Beyond [With
CDROM] (Official Comptia Guide) this guide consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world
now. This kind of book was represented how do the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer
use to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some research when he makes this book.
That's why this book suited all of you.

Tiffany Reyes:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book really can hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Principles of Computer Security:
CompTIA Security+ and Beyond [With CDROM] (Official Comptia Guide) which is having the e-book
version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.

Jesus Geist:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is composed or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of
news. On this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From
media social just like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the Principles of Computer Security: CompTIA Security+ and Beyond [With CDROM] (Official
Comptia Guide) when you needed it?
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