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This practical introduction explains exactly how digital circuits are designed, from the basic circuit to the
advanced system. It covers combinational logic circuits, which collect logic signals, to sequential logic
circuits, which embody time and memory to progress through sequences of states. The primer also highlights
digital arithmetic and the integrated circuits that implement the logic functions.

Based on the author's extensive experience in teaching digital electronics to undergraduates, the book
translates theory directly into practice and presents the essential information in a compact, digestible style.
Worked problems and examples are accompanied by abbreviated solutions, with demonstrations to ensure
that the design material and the circuits' operation are fully understood.

This is essential reading for any electronic or electrical engineering student new to digital electronics and
requiring a succinct yet comprehensive introduction.

Readership: First year BEng and MEng students (Electrical Engineering), undergraduate Computer Science
& Electronics students, Physics students taking Electronics modules.
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From reader reviews:

Rita Campanelli:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the e-book entitled Digital Electronics: A Primer : Introductory Logic Circuit
Design (Icp Primers in Electronics and Computer Science). Try to make book Digital Electronics: A Primer :
Introductory Logic Circuit Design (Icp Primers in Electronics and Computer Science) as your pal. It means
that it can for being your friend when you experience alone and beside that course make you smarter than in
the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you more confidence because you can know
every thing by the book. So , we need to make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Patrick Vanmeter:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or
their particular friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different
to fill your current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book can be option to fill your free of
charge time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If
you want to consider look for book, may be the e-book untitled Digital Electronics: A Primer : Introductory
Logic Circuit Design (Icp Primers in Electronics and Computer Science) can be excellent book to read. May
be it might be best activity to you.

Stephen Adams:

Reading a book to get new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When
you study a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, due
to the fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of
book that you have read. If you would like get information about your research, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, in addition
to soon. The Digital Electronics: A Primer : Introductory Logic Circuit Design (Icp Primers in Electronics
and Computer Science) will give you a new experience in looking at a book.

Heidi Garcia:

Reserve is one of source of expertise. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen require book to know the up-date information of year to year. As we know
those textbooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. Through the book Digital Electronics: A Primer : Introductory Logic Circuit Design (Icp Primers in
Electronics and Computer Science) we can get more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people?
To get creative person must love to read a book. Just choose the best book that acceptable with your aim.



Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this book Digital Electronics: A Primer : Introductory Logic
Circuit Design (Icp Primers in Electronics and Computer Science). You can more attractive than now.
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