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TO LEAD A NATION.... From Jeffrey Archer, author of the bestselling Kane & Abel, comes this
spellbinding tale in its complete and original form, published for the first time in the U.S. First Among
Equals chronicles the lives of four extraordinary men who battle for a prize that only one of them can win -
to become Prime Minister. CHARLES SEYMOUR: An accident of birth kept him from an earldom, but
nothing and no one can keep him from what he believes is his destiny. ANDREW FRASER: His father was a
football hero to thousands. Andrew intends to be a political hero to millions. SIMON KERSLAKE: Born not
quite of the true upper class, Simon is determined to lift himself as high as his dreams and the voters allow.
RAY GOULD: Son of a Leeds butcher, Ray realizes early on that his keen intellect and his driving ambition
can raise him from the back streets to No. 10 Downing Street. Through three tumultuous decades of bitter
rivalry, they fight for Britain's most powerful office-;a rivalry that sets honor against deceit, love against
hate, and loyalty against betrayal.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Vu:

The book First Among Equals can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the great thing like a book First Among Equals? A few of
you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that book can give many data for us. It is absolutely
proper. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you can give for
each other; you may share all of these. Book First Among Equals has simple shape but you know: it has great
and big function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a e-book. So it is
very wonderful.

Carissa Taylor:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With studying you can get a
lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with their
story or maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the publications. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children,
there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors these days always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some research before they write for their book. One of them is this
First Among Equals.

Timothy Roesch:

The reserve with title First Among Equals contains a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get
a lot of benefit after read this book. This particular book exist new expertise the information that exist in this
e-book represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to understand how the
improvement of the world. This book will bring you within new era of the globalization. You can read the e-
book on your own smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Dorothy Alvarez:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more important
than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time very little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. On the list of books in the
top record in your reading list is First Among Equals. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Inclines can
get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upwards and review this reserve you can get many
advantages.
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