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In A Place for Wonder, Georgia Heard and Jennifer McDonough discuss how to create "a landscape of
wonder," a primary classroom where curiosity, creativity, and exploration are encouraged. For it is these
characteristics, the authors write, that develop intelligent, inquiring, life-long learners. The authors' research
shows that many primary grade state standards encourage teaching for understanding, critical thinking,
creativity, and question asking, and promote the development of children who have the attributes of
inventiveness, curiosity, engagement, imagination, and creativity. With these goals in mind, Georgia and
Jennifer provide teachers with numerous, practical ways--setting up "wonder centers," gathering data though
senses, teaching nonfiction craft--they can create a classroom environment where students' questions and
observations are part of daily work. They also present a step-by-step guide to planning a nonfiction reading
and writing unit of study--creating a nonfiction book, which includes creating a table of contents, writing
focused chapters, using "wow" words, and developing point of view. A Place for Wonder will help teachers
reclaim their classrooms as a place where true learning is the norm.
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From reader reviews:

John Moore:

This book untitled A Place for Wonder: Reading and Writing Nonfiction in the Primary Grades to be one of
several books that best seller in this year, that's because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit
onto it. You will easily to buy this book in the book store or you can order it via online. The publisher on this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, because you can read this book in
your Smartphone. So there is no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Regina Schubert:

Reading a book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can easily
share their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their particular reader
with their story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the ebooks. But also they
write about the information about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or
how to teach your children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to
improve their proficiency in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write on their book. One
of them is this A Place for Wonder: Reading and Writing Nonfiction in the Primary Grades.

Paul Avila:

This A Place for Wonder: Reading and Writing Nonfiction in the Primary Grades is great publication for you
because the content which can be full of information for you who else always deal with world and still have
to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it information accurately using great coordinate
word or we can claim no rambling sentences included. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole
information in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but hard core
information with attractive delivering sentences. Having A Place for Wonder: Reading and Writing
Nonfiction in the Primary Grades in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous
just one. We can say that no reserve that offer you world in ten or fifteen moment right but this reserve
already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt in which?

Henry Stehle:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source that filled update of news. In this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social such as
newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just looking for the
A Place for Wonder: Reading and Writing Nonfiction in the Primary Grades when you essential it?
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