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Natural Computing is the field of research that investigates both human-designed computing inspired by
nature and computing taking place in nature, i.e., it investigates models and computational techniques
inspired by nature and also it investigates phenomena taking place in nature in terms of information
processing.

Examples of the first strand of research covered by the handbook include neural computation inspired by the
functioning of the brain; evolutionary computation inspired by Darwinian evolution of species; cellular
automata inspired by intercellular communication; swarm intelligence inspired by the behavior of groups of
organisms; artificial immune systems inspired by the natural immune system; artificial life systems inspired
by the properties of natural life in general; membrane computing inspired by the compartmentalized ways in
which cells process information; and amorphous computing inspired by morphogenesis. Other examples of
natural-computing paradigms are molecular computing and quantum computing, where the goal is to replace
traditional electronic hardware, e.g., by bioware in molecular computing. In molecular computing, data are
encoded as biomolecules and then molecular biology tools are used to transform the data, thus performing
computations. In quantum computing, one exploits quantum-mechanical phenomena to perform
computations and secure communications more efficiently than classical physics and, hence, traditional
hardware allows.

The second strand of research covered by the handbook, computation taking place in nature, is represented
by investigations into, among others, the computational nature of self-assembly, which lies at the core of
nanoscience, the computational nature of developmental processes, the computational nature of biochemical
reactions, the computational nature of bacterial communication, the computational nature of brain processes,
and the systems biology approach to bionetworks where cellular processes are treated in terms of
communication and interaction, and, hence, in terms of computation.

We are now witnessing exciting interaction between computer science and the natural sciences. While the
natural sciences are rapidly absorbing notions, techniques and methodologies intrinsic to information
processing, computer science is adapting and extending its traditional notion of computation, and
computational techniques, to account for computation taking place in nature around us. Natural Computing is
an important catalyst for this two-way interaction, and this handbook is a major record of this important
development.
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From reader reviews:

Brooke Jenkins:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content.
As we know that book is very important for people. The book Handbook of Natural Computing:4 vol set
(Springer Reference) was making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more
information. It is rather advantages for you. The guide Handbook of Natural Computing:4 vol set (Springer
Reference) is not only giving you far more new information but also to get your friend when you truly feel
bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship while using book
Handbook of Natural Computing:4 vol set (Springer Reference). You never truly feel lose out for everything
if you read some books.

Sharon Wilson:

This Handbook of Natural Computing:4 vol set (Springer Reference) book is not ordinary book, you have
after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is definitely information
inside this book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you
will get. This specific Handbook of Natural Computing:4 vol set (Springer Reference) without we recognize
teach the one who reading through it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't be worry
Handbook of Natural Computing:4 vol set (Springer Reference) can bring any time you are and not make
your tote space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cell
phone. This Handbook of Natural Computing:4 vol set (Springer Reference) having great arrangement in
word and layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Kim Deyoung:

The actual book Handbook of Natural Computing:4 vol set (Springer Reference) has a lot info on it. So when
you read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The writer
makes some research prior to write this book. That book very easy to read you can get the point easily after
scanning this book.

Rosemary Robinson:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this reserve. This Handbook of Natural Computing:4
vol set (Springer Reference) is simple to create you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train and also
soon. If you did not get much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It
is make you much easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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