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Between 1895 and 1904 a great wave of mergers swept through the manufacturing sector of the United
States' economy. This book explores the causes of the mergers, arguing that there was nothing natural or
inevitable about turn-of-the-century combinations. Despite this conclusion, the author does not accept the
view that they were necessarily a threat to competition. She shows that most of these consolidations were
less efficient that the new rivals that appeared almost immediately, and they quickly lost their positions of
market dominance. More over, in most of those few cases where consolidations proved to be more efficient,
the nation was better off for their formation. Some exceptions occurred, however, and in these instances anti-
trust policy should have had a significant role to play. Unfortunately, the peculiar division of power and
authority that characterizes the Federal system of government prevented an effective policy from emerging.
Ironically, anti-trust policy proved much more effective against small firms in relatively competitive
industries than large firms in oligopolistic ones.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Case:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book especially book
entitled The Great Merger Movement in American Business, 1895-1904 your brain will drift away trough
every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely might be your mind friends.
Imaging each and every word written in a book then become one form conclusion and explanation this
maybe you never get before. The The Great Merger Movement in American Business, 1895-1904 giving you
one more experience more than blown away the mind but also giving you useful facts for your better life
within this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern is your body and mind will likely be pleased
when you are finished reading through it, like winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending
spare time activity?

Anthony Collins:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, limited story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting The Great Merger
Movement in American Business, 1895-1904 that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied simply
by reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know
world much better then how they react toward the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading practice
only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all of
you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you could pick The Great Merger Movement in
American Business, 1895-1904 become your starter.

Elisa Dumont:

In this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more precious than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you have to do is just
spending your time little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. Among the books in the top listing
in your reading list is The Great Merger Movement in American Business, 1895-1904. This book which can
be qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking right up
and review this book you can get many advantages.

Ronald Meyers:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by simply searching
from it. It is called of book The Great Merger Movement in American Business, 1895-1904. Contain your
knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make a person happier
to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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