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It seems rather of necessity than predilection in the sense of apologia that I should put on record in the first
place a plain statement of my personal position, as one who for many years of literary life has been, subject
to his spiritual and other limitations, an exponent of the higher mystic schools. It will be thought that I am
acting strangely in concerning myself at this day with what appears at first sight and simply a well-known
method of fortune-telling. Now, the opinions of some, even in the literary reviews, are of no importance
unless they happen to agree with our own, but in order to sanctify this doctrine we must take care that our
opinions, and the subjects out of which they arise, are concerned only with the highest. Yet it is just this
which may seem doubtful, in the present instance, not only to those, whom I respect within the proper
measures of detachment, but to some of more real consequence, seeing that their dedications are mine. To
these and to any I would say that after the most illuminated Frater Christian Rosy Cross had beheld the
Chemical Marriage in the Secret Palace of Transmutation, his story breaks off abruptly, with an intimation
that he expected next morning to be door-keeper. After the same manner, it happens more often than might
seem likely that those who have seen the Occult Powers of Nature through the most clearest veils of the
sacraments are those who assume thereafter the humblest offices of all about the House of Wisdom. By such
simple devices also are the Adepts and Great Masters in the secret orders distinguished from the cohort of
Neophytes as servi servorum mysterii. So also, or in a way which is not entirely unlike, we meet with the
Tarot cards at the outermost gates amidst the frittering? and debris of the so-called occult arts, about which
no one in their senses has suffered the smallest deception; and yet these cards belong in themselves to
another region, for they contain a very high symbolism, which is interpreted according to the Laws of Grace
rather than by the pretexts and intuitions of that which passes for divination.
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From reader reviews:

Julie Gailey:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, man feel need book if they found difficult problem as well as exercise. Well,
probably you'll have this The Illustrated Key to the Tarot: The Veil of Divination, Illustrating the Greater and
Lesser Arcana, Embracing the Veil and Its Symbols; Secret ... Outer Method of the Oracles, the Tarot in His.

Kristin Todd:

Reading a book being new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you learn a book
you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, as well as soon. The The
Illustrated Key to the Tarot: The Veil of Divination, Illustrating the Greater and Lesser Arcana, Embracing
the Veil and Its Symbols; Secret ... Outer Method of the Oracles, the Tarot in His will give you a new
experience in examining a book.

Daryl Church:

Is it anyone who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day simply by watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Illustrated Key to the Tarot: The
Veil of Divination, Illustrating the Greater and Lesser Arcana, Embracing the Veil and Its Symbols; Secret ...
Outer Method of the Oracles, the Tarot in His can be the reply, oh how comes? The new book you know.
You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd
activity. So what these books have than the others?

Jerry Ingle:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many question for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people
likes looking at, not only science book but additionally novel and The Illustrated Key to the Tarot: The Veil
of Divination, Illustrating the Greater and Lesser Arcana, Embracing the Veil and Its Symbols; Secret ...
Outer Method of the Oracles, the Tarot in His or even others sources were given knowledge for you. After
you know how the truly great a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science reserve was created for
teacher or even students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In various



other case, beside science guide, any other book likes The Illustrated Key to the Tarot: The Veil of
Divination, Illustrating the Greater and Lesser Arcana, Embracing the Veil and Its Symbols; Secret ... Outer
Method of the Oracles, the Tarot in His to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like
this one.
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