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Rollover crashes kill more than 10,000 occupants of passenger vehicles each year. As part of its mission to
reduce fatalities and injuries, since model year 2001 NHTSA has included rollover information as part of its
NCAP ratings. One of the primary means of assessing rollover risk is the static stability factor (SSF), a
measurement of a vehicle’s resistance to rollover. The higher the SSF, the lower the rollover risk. This report
tracks the trend in SSF over time, looking in particular at changes in various passenger vehicle types. Data
are presented for overall fleet average SSFs by vehicle type over a number of model years.
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From reader reviews:

Willie Collier:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts even knowledge to
make these individuals keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe
may update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know which you should start with. This Trends in the Static Stability Factor of
Passenger Cars, Light Trucks, and Vans: NHTSA Technical Report DOT HS 809 868 is our
recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and wish
in this era.

Christina Mundell:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their reader with
their story as well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the books. But also they write about
the data about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children,
there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their expertise in
writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of them is this Trends in the
Static Stability Factor of Passenger Cars, Light Trucks, and Vans: NHTSA Technical Report DOT HS 809
868.

Teresa Propst:

This Trends in the Static Stability Factor of Passenger Cars, Light Trucks, and Vans: NHTSA Technical
Report DOT HS 809 868 is great guide for you because the content which can be full of information for you
who else always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it
facts accurately using great coordinate word or we can state no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are
read that hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward
sentences but hard core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Trends in the Static Stability
Factor of Passenger Cars, Light Trucks, and Vans: NHTSA Technical Report DOT HS 809 868 in your hand
like having the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no book that offer you
world inside ten or fifteen minute right but this publication already do that. So , this really is good reading
book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt which?

Gerald McMullen:

Reading a book to become new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you
examine a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your



knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on
what kinds of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your review, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel,
comics, in addition to soon. The Trends in the Static Stability Factor of Passenger Cars, Light Trucks, and
Vans: NHTSA Technical Report DOT HS 809 868 provide you with new experience in examining a book.
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